
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

0UR LADY’S, Chesham Bois & St. AIDAN’S, Little Chalfont  
                  Priests: Fr. Roy Karakkattu & Fr. Kenneth Payne  

                                                     Deacons: Peter Collins & David Curtis          
 Tel: 01494 727469   Email: info@ourladyschurch-cheshambois.org 

                Websites: www.ourladyschurch-cheshambois.org                        www.staidanslittlechalfont.co.uk             

Parish Secretary: Ala Dabrowska: 01494 763518   

6th June, Corpus Christi 2021 Year B 

Parish of Our Lady of Perpetual Succour, Chesham Bois Parish of St. Aidan, Little Chalfont 

Saturday       5th June         5.00 pm     (Vigil Mass)   

Sunday          6th June         9.30 am     (Corpus Christi) 

Monday         7th June        9.30 am      Feria 

Tuesday        8th June        9.30 am      Feria 

Wednesday  9th June      9.30 am      Feria 

Thursday     10th June      9.30 am      Feria 

Friday           11th June      7.00 pm     (The Sacred Heart of Jesus) 

Saturday      12th June      5.00pm     (Vigil Mass)  

Sunday         13th June    8.00am     Latin Mass  

                                              9.30am    Parish Mass   

Sat       5thJune         6.00pm        (Vigil Mass) 
 

Sun       6th June        11.00am      (Corpus Christi) 

  

Wed      9th  June        7.30pm       Feria 

                               

Fri         11th June      9.30am      (The Sacred Heart of Jesus) 

Sat        12th June        6.00pm       (Vigil Mass)      

Sun        13th June       11.00 am     

Benediction:    Friday  6.30-7pm  Benediction: Friday 9.00am – 9.30am 

Confessions:    Monday to Saturday, After Mass     Confessions: Wednesday & Friday After Mass  

Mass Intentions: Wed (Ray Parsons RIP) Mass Intentions: Sat (Jonathan Newson), Sun (Jack Kelly RIP), 
Mon (Cora Walsh RIP), Fri (Bernadette Cummings RIP) 

Second Collection Next Weekend: There will be a retiring 

collection at all Masses next weekend for Day for Life.  

 Mass Intentions: Kindly use the sheet of paper kept in the 

sacristy in both Churches for booking your Masses. If it is an 

anniversary mass, please write RIP after the deceased 

person’s name, or if it is a special intention, please mention 

that as well. If you would like to sign a mass card, please meet  

me before or after mass. You can also book the mass by email 

or by phone call. The intentions will appear in the newsletter 

from Saturday to Friday every week.  

Offering Mass for the Dead means praying for those souls that 

are in Purgatory, hoping that their time there is shortened. It 

is our duty to pray for the dead and offer masses for them. 

Masses can also be offered for non-Catholics, as the Church 

states that their souls can also be reunited with God in 

Heaven. The offering of a Mass can also bring comfort and 

hope to those still on Earth that the souls of the departed 

have returned to God. 

First Communion: There will be a meeting with the parents 

of children yet to receive the first communion in Our Lady’s 

on Monday 7th June at 7.30pm in the guild room. The new 

batch will commence their classes from September in both 

Churches. Details will be available soon.  

Celebrating Eucharistic Ministers: Bishop David and 

our Diocesan Liturgy Commission invites all those who have 

served as Lay Ministers of the Eucharist to join him in 

praying a holy hour on the Solemnity of Corpus Christi, 

Sunday 6th June 2021 at 3pm in the Cathedral. Lay 

Ministers are invited to attend in person or to join via the live 

stream. 

 

 

Baptisms: Couples who wish to baptize their child or children, 
either in Our Lady’s or St. Aidan’s, kindly meet me personally or 
any of our Deacons and fill the application form. The forms are 
available in both Churches, please ask for it.  

Rosary & Benediction Before Mass: We have started devotion 
to the Holy Rosary and adoration of the Blessed Sacrament in 
both Churches. Make an earnest effort to participate in these 
spiritual exercises and receive the graces. Rosary recitation will 
be from Monday to Thursday in Our Lady’s at 9.00am before 
mass and Benediction on Friday evening 6.30pm. In St. Aidan’s, 
the rosary will be on Wednesday at 7.00pm before Mass and 
Benediction is on Friday at 9.00am before Mass.  

Volunteers Needed: I am incredibly thankful to all the 
volunteers in both churches for your selfless and dedicated 
services. I thank God for your gift to me and to the community. 
We love you and appreciate you.  Let me also make a humble  
appeal to all others to respond generously to the need of our 
Churches. There aren’t enough or no one to look after certain 
departments in the church, particularly in Our Lady’s. In Our 
Lady’s, we need a Sacristan, Cleaners, Flower arrangers and 
Welcomers very urgently. Please come forward and offer your 
service to the Church.  

Confessions: Kindly note the time for confessions in both 

Churches and avail the opportunity to receive forgiveness from 

God. 

 

 

 

 

Thank you for the Offertory Collection Last Week 
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